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Abstract 
Following safety and financial issues, ecological degradation has risen to become the most crucial problem in global politics, and it is still a 
major concern in the political economy of the world. The topic of warming temperatures is crucial to current worldwide environmental politics 
due to its close ties to economic expansion and advancement. Development is negatively impacted by climate change, which is further 
exacerbated by unsustainable growth. The impact of climate change has major effects on attempts to combat poor and ensure food security in an 
environment of growth, particularly in emerging nations, and it may cause a separation of economic expansion from poverty reduction. The 
review discusses two interconnected aspects of the problem: first, what the issue of climate change is and why it is thought to be the most 
important problem facing humanity; and second, climate change and initiatives to alleviate poverty sustainably. Efforts to reduce poverty will 
benefit from the policies addressing environmental prevention. In order to reduce poverty, it is crucial that policies for equitable growth are 
implemented and adjusted to the climate change. 
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Introduction 
In international politics, the state of the world's atmosphere 
has changed. During the "UN Conference on the Human 
Environment (UNCHE) in Stockholm in 1972," the 
importance of the environment worldwide in international 
politics officially started. The topic picked up steam in the 
course of the 1980s, and by the start of the 1990s, it had 
replaced security and economic concerns as the third most 
important global political issue. It has continued to be one of 
the main political topics of the twenty-first century. The 
impact of climate change is the key issue in today's 
worldwide environmental politics. Researchers seem to agree 
that because it is so closely related to the activities of growth 
& development of the economy, global warming is possibly 
one of the most severe environmental issues facing society 
today. The divide between developed countries (North) as 
well as developing countries (South) is emphasized by the 
question of growth and prosperity in the context of worldwide 
environmental politics.  
A quarter of the humanity lives in the North, which also holds 
almost all of the world's wealth. The southern region, on the 
other hand, has 20% of the wealth and around 80% of the 
population [25]. The techniques of financial expansion and 
growth through industrialization are relatively new to the 

South. Any workable solution must therefore consider both 
the issue of "sustainability in development" and the 
"environment and development" axis. Since worldwide 
approaches are needed to address the issue of climate change, 
there must also be significant national contributions. In 
modern international politics, complex multilateralism is used 
in multilateral forums to try to find solutions on global scale. 
Educational facilities. National governments continued to 
have a significant influence on the result of this difficult 
international process. But as we transition from the global 
system, where the nation-state was the only significant actor, 
to a worldwide system, there is a growing importance of no 
state entities, including international movements for social 
change and transnational companies [17].  
Consequently, both governments and nongovernmental 
organizations are involved in the development of worldwide 
environmental frameworks through international 
organizations [18].  
Thus, two interconnected elements of the problem will be 
addressed by analytic construct. The definition of climate 
change as well as the reasons why it is thought to be the most 
important issue facing humanity will be covered in the first 
section. The second section focuses on measures to reduce 
poverty ethically and the effects of global warming [19]. 
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Knowledge of Climate Change and its Effects 
Worldwide warming is the term used to describe the planet's 
increasing temperatures, which is mostly caused by emissions 
from humanity or just plain human activity. The term 
"anthropogenic emissions" refers to greenhouse gases such as 
nitrous oxide, carbon dioxide, methane, and water vapor that 
are released into the atmosphere as a result of human activity 
[20]. 
Those greenhouse gases make it easier for heat from the sun's 
rays to be retained, which raises the temperature of the 
planet's surface. The most significant of these greenhouse 
gases is carbon dioxide, which is produced mostly by human 
beings and makes up the majority of the group [16]. 
Coal, oil, gas, and wood are examples of fossil fuels that 
release carbon dioxide into the atmosphere. The use of fossil 
fuels has grown enormously since the dawn of 
industrialization, and this has resulted in significantly higher 
human-caused releases of carbon dioxide into the atmosphere, 
seriously disrupting the natural carbon cycle. Due to the 
utilization of petroleum and coal, the atmospheric 
concentration of greenhouse gases has increased by over 
thirty percent over the past century [1]. 
Additionally, prior the beginning of the Industrial Revolution 
in 1750, there were roughly 280 parts per million by volume 
of atmospheric carbon dioxide prior the dawn of the Industrial 
Revolution. By 1994, it had risen to 358 ppmv & was 
increasing by 1.5 ppmv year. If this pattern holds, the 
atmospheric carbon dioxide concentration by the end of the 
21st century will be close to 5000 ppmv, more than twice the 
level of the era prior to industrialization [2]. 
From the past century, the average global temperature has 
risen by 0.74 degrees Celsius as a result of a thirty-three 
percent rise in atmospheric carbon dioxide. By 2100, it is 
anticipated that the global average temperature would have 
increased by 2 to 4 ° Celsius [3]. 
The real temperature rise will rely on how quickly the amount 
of carbon dioxide pollution increased. The rise in the average 
global temperature can be kept to a maximum of two degrees 
Celsius if the rate of growing carbon dioxide emissions is 
slow. Yet, if emissions raise enough, the average worldwide 
temperature might rise by up to 4 ° Celsius. This rise in 
climate has caused the sea ice in the Arctic to melt, which has 
caused the level of the ocean to rise by roughly seventeen cm 
at the same time. While predictions vary, there seems to be 
agreement across scientists that if global warming is not 
stabilized by 2100, the ocean level will rise by one meter [4]. 
Extended modifications to moisture, clouds that and 
precipitation have been brought on by a steady rise in 
temperature. In most geographical areas of the world, the 
occurrence of excessive precipitation has increased over the 
last fifty years, and this trend is anticipated to continue as the 
average global temperature rises. Due to its close ties to 
current patterns of growth and development in the economy, 
global warming is seen as one of the greatest threats before 
society [24]. 
Growth and development in the economy are negatively 
impacted by global warming, which is further exacerbated by 
the present mechanisms of economic development and 
expansion. A few instances might be used to demonstrate the 
dual connection among economic progress and climate 
change [5]. 
Technological mobility, particularly motor vehicles, or 
industrialization have both increased atmospheric carbon 
dioxide levels over time, which has led to arise in the global 
average temperature. The profitability of industry and 

agriculture is negatively impacted by the rise in temperature. 
Because to the rise in worldwide mean temperature, there are 
more instances of excessive rainfall, which has a negative 
influence on agricultural production. The effects of climate 
change are equally detrimental to civilization [6]. 
The citizens who live together the coastline, especially in 
countries that are developing where population density in 
coastal regions is very substantial and more than half of 
humanity is from disadvantaged backgrounds and depends on 
climate-sensitive occupations like farming and the fishing 
industry, are in grave danger as a result of the rise in the level 
of the sea caused by the increase in the average temperature 
around the world. The financial social implications of 
uprooting people and losing a source of income have a 
negative influence on progress [7]. 
 
The Climate Crisis and the Reduction of Poverty 
Because of natural disasters, environmental degradation plays 
a significant impact in both maintaining and increasing the 
number of people living under the poverty limit. For example, 
floodwaters result in asset loss as well as medical shocks. 
Floods cause the loss of homes, animals, & harvests. Disease 
shocks, like post-flood pandemics, result in medical expenses 
and lost wages. Due to their lack of social protection, the poor 
are particularly at risk to climate-related shocks. The impact 
of climate change is likely to make these shocks worse and 
cause the separation of economic growth from efforts to 
reduce suffering. It is commonly accepted that once poor 
people or families are lifted out of impoverishment, they will 
stay there. This is a false evaluation since even if a household 
escapes impoverishment, they are still susceptible to falling 
back into it [8]. 
Additionally, families who are barely getting by are equally 
probable to fall into hardship as everyone else as a result of 
natural disasters. An analyst's ground-breaking work strongly 
demonstrates that climate change unexpected events, like 
drought and floods, can have an impact on attempts to reduce 
poverty [9]. 
According to the research, that took place over the course of 
twenty-five years in 36 villages in the Indian state of Andhra 
Pradesh, fourteen percent of homes were lifted out of poverty, 
but twelve percent of households that were not poor fell 
below the poverty threshold [22]. 
The amount of poverty reduced as a result was only two 
percent. The graph below shows how initiatives to reduce 
hunger did not have the expected impact. Additionally, it 
shows that if just twelve percent rather than fourteen percent 
rise above the poverty threshold or if just thirteen percent 
rather of fourteen percent fall under it, the poverty rate would 
only be reduced by one percent, resulting in a fifty percent 
decrease in suffering [10]. 
According to the World Bank's research and the United 
Nations Framework Convention on Climate Change, climate 
change has made weather-sensitive crises harsher and is 
projected to make them worse still. Disasters caused by nature 
are already on the rise, & the poor are increasingly frequently 
subjected to and vulnerable to them. Natural disasters will 
become more intense and more frequent over time [21]. 
 One estimate places the contribution of climate change at 
seventy-five for moderate temperature extremes over terrain 
or eighteen percent for light precipitation extremes. Heat 
waves, which are typically unusual, are predicted to increase 
more frequency, killing additional individuals around the 
world, especially in developing nations [11]. 
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The industry that is most impacted by climate-sensitive 
shocks is agriculture, which supplies a significant portion of 
humanity in nations that are developing with a means of 
subsistence. Continuous warming temperatures in 
combination with regular catastrophes adversely affect 
agricultural production and raise costs as a result. The 
efficiency of persons who are impoverished and frequently 
work outdoors, such as in open fields, is reduced by high 
temperatures. Reduced earnings are a result of lower 
productivity [12]. 
The increase in consumer product costs and the reduction in 
income from farming would have the greatest impact on poor 
households and households that are close to the poverty level 
since they spend a disproportionately high portion of their 
earnings on consumption. So, the agriculture sector's losses, 
the increase in food costs, and the reduction in revenue drive 
people who are vulnerable into poverty [13]. 
A further significant topic to consider is the well-being of the 
underprivileged and climate change. Infections and medical 
problems are more likely to have an effect on and a greater 
impact on the poor. The well-being of the poor will face more 
risks as a result of global warming. In order to reduce poverty, 
health issues are crucial for two reasons [14]. 
 Initially illnesses like malaria and diarrhea impact the poor & 
are probably made worse by warming temperatures. Just a 
slight rise in temperature enhances the spread of malaria. The 
total number of individuals susceptible for malaria may rise 
by five percent, or over 150 million people, if the average 
worldwide temperature rose by two degrees Celsius. Tent’s 
crucial because there is no innate resistance to malaria among 
humans [15]. 
 
Conclusion 
Since the poor are particularly susceptible to climatic-related 
illnesses like dengue &diarrhea, the danger to their health will 
increase as a result of global warming. In impoverished places 
like Africa beneath the Sahara and South Asia, where 
productivity in agriculture is expected to fall and prices to 
rise, climate change may also result in a danger to the 
availability of food. Actually, the need to eliminate poverty 
and mitigate the risk of the poor in developing nations is 
urgent given the effects of global warming. Efforts to reduce 
poverty will benefit from the policies addressing global 
warming prevention. In order to reduce poverty, it is crucial 
that policies for inclusive development are implemented and 
adjusted to the climate shifts. 
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